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Conference series organizing 3rd World Summit on 
Neonatology Nursing and Primary Health Care which is 
going to be held in Prague, Czech Republic in the month of 
November 09-10, 2020 with a theme “Enlightening the 
New Horizons in Neonatal Care & Primary Health Care”. 
The aim of Neonatology Nursing 2020 is review the new 
findings and advancements in the field of Pediatrics This 
event will be of special interest to any professional 
involved in Neonatology Nursing domain, such as, health 
care professions, pediatric nurse practitioners, 
manufacturers of pediatric drugs & health care devices, 
academicians Researchers, Scientists, Graduates, Post 
Graduates and PhD Scholars, students, health care 
professionals of any disciplines. It will provide a platform 
for multidisciplinary exchange of data to accelerate 
pediatric disorders and shed light on the many scientific 
discoveries altogether aspects of Neonatology Nursing and 
Primary Health Care.  

Conference Series organizes the 3rd World Summit on 
Neonatology Nursing and Primary Health Care which 
focuses mainly on the present health scenario of neonates 
and their developmental conditions. Neonatology Nursing 
2020 is going to be to review the new findings and 
advancements within the field of Pediatrics. This event will 
be of special interest to any professional involved in health 
care domain, Neonatol doctors and Nurse practitioners  
Neonatology Nursing 2020 will be organized with the 
theme “Enlightening the New Horizons in Neonatal Care & 
Primary Health Care” on November 09-10, 2020 at Prague, 
Czech Republic. 

The conference focuses on the latest trends and 
advancements in treatment and care of neonates related 
to their health in different Neonatal and Pediatric fields. 

The conference attendees will get fascinated with special 
events and speeches from the experts in various fields of 
health care and get an opportunity to gain knowledge with 
regard to the current emerging trends in this filed. It will 
provide a platform for multidisciplinary exchange of 
information to accelerate pediatric disorders and shed 
light on the significant scientific discoveries in all aspects of 

Neonatology Health Care. Above all, it will be a meeting 
place to network and meet like-minded people in the field 
of Pediatrics, Adolescent Medicine, Health Care and 
Research. 

Neonatology Nursing 2020 will provide an opportunity to 
young researchers through the initiatives like Young 
Research Forum, Poster Presentation and Scientific 
Meetings. Through a spread of state-of-the-art sessions, 
keynote lectures, roundtable discussions, workshops and 
sessions including oral and poster presentations, the 
congress theme will underpin the necessity for 
collaboration and cooperation of individuals from a good 
range of professional backgrounds; it'll provide an 
exquisite forum for you to upgrade your knowledge and 
explore the innovations in Neonatology Nursing and 
Primary Health Care. 

This exciting congress will compile researchers, clinicians 
and other healthcare professionals in a world forum, 
enabling the exchange of the newest advances in both 
science and practice, within the research and clinical 
community; the Congress will strive to supply many 
networking opportunities, providing you with the chance 
to satisfy and interact with the leading scientists and 
researchers, friends and colleagues as well as sponsors and 
exhibitors. We feel grateful in welcoming you all at a single 
place in providing your valuable thoughts on Neonatal 
Nursing, Neonatal Gastroenterology, Perinatology, 
Pediatric Nursing, Clinical Nursing Pediatric Surgery, 
Neonatal Nutrition, Neonatal Resuscitation, Primary Health 
Care, Primary care in Mental Health. 
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